

Office : 2453969 University : 2435248 Extension : : 2435259 2617, 2618

Post Graduate Department of Chemistry

University of Jammu

('A⁺' Grade University- Accredited by NAAC) Baba Saheb Ambedkar Road, Jammu - 180 006

No. PGD/Chem/ 23/ 3517

Dated 01-08-23

e-NIT

Sealed e-NIT (technical & financial bid) are invited from reputed manufacturers/authorized dealers/distributors/sole selling agents for the supply, installation and commissioning of the following equipment:

 For the purchase of spares/consumables and repair of water purification system (Labjal-model LAN NE -15UV).

For further details, please visit https://jktenders.gov.in

The complete tender document should be submitted only online through https://jktenders.gov.in

Prof. H. N. Shelkh Head of the Department

POST GRADUATE DEPARTMENT OF CHEMISTRY, UNIVERSITY OF JAMMU, JAMMU.

NO.: PGD/CHEM/23/3496 DATED: 02.08.2023

NOTICE INVITING TENDERS FOR THE PURCHASE OF SPARES/ CONSUMABLES AND REPAIR OF WATER PUIFICATION SYSTEM (WPS). Model-LAN NE-15UV.

Offers (rates and terms & conditions) along with detailed literature and specifications are invited from manufacturers/authorized distributors/dealer etc. for supply/repair of following item with terms and conditions mentioned below:

TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS:-

S.No.	Name of the specifications	Quantity
1.	Power supply module-smart NE E EDI	01
2.	2-Position -3- way valve	01
3.	Pre- Treatment module-Transverse outlets, 2 pcs	01
4.	Ultra purification cartridge-transverse outlets, 1 pcs	01
5.	Set of 10 inch pre-filteration candles	04
6.	Installation/Service charges if any.	01

TERM & CONDITIONS:-

- 1. Tenders should be addressed to, "Head of the Department, Department of Chemistry, Baba Saheb Ambdekar Road, New University Campus, University of Jammu, Jammu 180 006".
- 2. Delivery of goods should be FOR Department of Chemistry, University of Jammu, Jammu.

General Sale tax/custom duty/excise/entry tax or any other tax, if any, should be clearly mentioned. Rates should be inclusive of custom clearance, insurance etc. It may kindly be noted that University of Jammu will not bear any cost/expenditure arising out of loss during transportation etc. Cost of equipment should include transportation charges and insurance charges upto FOR destination. <u>University of Jammu is exempted from Custom Duty under DSIR registration. DSIR certificate shall be provided by the University of Jammu.</u>

Firm shall be required to submit complete information/brochure/catalogue along with the offer, if any.

- 3. Concession to educational institutions, if any, should be clearly mentioned.
- 4. Products confirming to particular standards (ISO, ISI etc.) should be clearly mentioned.

POST GRADUATE DEPARTMENT OF CHEMISTRY, UNIVERSITY OF JAMMU, JAMMU.

- 5. In case any item is your proprietary product or if you are sole manufacturer/distributor of requisite item, a certificate to this effect should be enclosed.
- 6. It is at discretion of the competent authority to reject one/all tenders/part of tender without assigning any reason, thereof.
- 7. In case seller fails to complete in full, all deliveries of product in accordance with supply order; the seller shall be responsible for the liquidity damages. Thereafter the buyer, will have right to terminate supply order in the case of such delay beyond period mentioned by seller in the offer and buyer will have total discretion to buy product from the market/other supplier at the lowest rate.
- 8. An undertaking should be submitted by your concern that rates quoted in this offer are lowest/at par with rates quoted to other Govt./Semi-Govt. institution in the country and your concern/firm has not sold your product to any other organization in India at lowest price than the price quoted in this offer.
- Debarment of the bidding firms shall be governed by Rule No. 151 of GFR 2017; Ministry of Finance, GOI, as mentioned below:
 - (i) A bidder shall be debarred if he has been convicted of an offence-
 - (a) under the Prevention of Corruption Act, 1988; or
 - (b) the Indian Penal Code or any other law for the time being in force, for causing any loss of life or property or causing a threat to public health as part of execution of a public procurement contract.
 - (ii) A bidder debarred under sub-section (i) or any successor of the bidder shall not be eligible to participate in a procurement process of any procuring entity for a period not exceeding three years commencing from the date of debarment. Department of Commerce (DGS&D) will maintain such list which will also be displayed on the website of DGS&D as well as Central Public Procurement Portal.
 - (iii) A procuring entity may debar a bidder or any of its successors, from participating in any procurement process undertaken by it, for a period not exceeding two years, if it determines that the bidder has breached the code of integrity. The Ministry/Department will maintain such list which will also be displayed on their website.
 - (iv) The bidder shall not be debarred unless such bidder has been given a reasonable opportunity to represent against such debarment
- 10. All the pages of soft copy of the offer should be endorsed along with the stamp/seal of the firm.
- Financial bid of only technically qualified tenderer shall be opened. If the Technical Bid are not in order or are deficient in some respect, the commercial bid in respect of such tender shall not be opened.
- 12. Technical specifications of the required instruments/equipments/articles are given above.
- 13. OEM certificate is required form the firm.

eProcurement System Government of Jammu And Kashmir

.

Constant of the second	Image: Second S	K	ashm		Те	ender	r Details					
Basic Details Organisation Chain University Department[]Jammu University[[HOD Chemistry Tender Reference No./PGD/CHEM/23/3496 Withdrawal Allowed Yes Tender ID 2023_UDJK_224687_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes Fender ID 2023_UDJK_224687_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes Pender Type Open Tender Form of contract Item Rate Seneral Technical No Covers 2 Valuation Allowed Yes Yes No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Ves Cover No Cover Document Type Description Il ender Tipe (PreQual/Technical .pdf OEM authorization CERTIFICATE REQUI Pup f .pdf Cover field is required GS Tregistration certificate is required Pup f .pdf Cover field is required Cover OP OP PAR CARD REQUIRED TRETURNS FOR TH Lender Fee Details, Total Fee in ₹ * 0.001 .pdf EMD Fee Details EMD Fee Details EMD Fee Mage Mage Lender Fee No No EMD Fee Details EMD Fee Mage </th <th>Basic Details Organisation Chain University Department [Jammu University][HOD Chemistry Fender Reference Number No./PGD/CHEM/23/3496 Withdrawal Allowed Yes Fender ID 2023_UDJX_224687_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes Fender Type Open Tender Form of contract Item Rate Fender Type Open Tender Form of contract Item Rate Seneral Technical Seneral Technical Valuation Allowed No Yes Sayment Mode Not Applicable Is Multi Currency Allowed For BOQ Yes ayment Mode Not Applicable Js Multi Currency Allowed For Fee No No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Iteravise Technical Evaluation Allowed No Cover No Cover Document Type Description OEM authorization CERTIFICATE REQUIR Padf OEM authorization CERTIFICATE REQUIR Past CERTIFICATE REQUIR Past COPY OF PAN CARD IS Required .pdf .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD IS REQUIRED COPY OF PAN CARD IS REQUIRED No .ender Fee Int Total Fee int ₹ - 0.00] EMD Fee Details FINANCIAL BID EMD Amount in ₹ 0.00 EMD Percentage</th> <th>T</th> <th>ender</th> <th>S</th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th>D</th> <th>ate : 04-Aug-202</th> <th>3 12:24</th>	Basic Details Organisation Chain University Department [Jammu University][HOD Chemistry Fender Reference Number No./PGD/CHEM/23/3496 Withdrawal Allowed Yes Fender ID 2023_UDJX_224687_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes Fender Type Open Tender Form of contract Item Rate Fender Type Open Tender Form of contract Item Rate Seneral Technical Seneral Technical Valuation Allowed No Yes Sayment Mode Not Applicable Is Multi Currency Allowed For BOQ Yes ayment Mode Not Applicable Js Multi Currency Allowed For Fee No No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Iteravise Technical Evaluation Allowed No Cover No Cover Document Type Description OEM authorization CERTIFICATE REQUIR Padf OEM authorization CERTIFICATE REQUIR Past CERTIFICATE REQUIR Past COPY OF PAN CARD IS Required .pdf .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD IS REQUIRED COPY OF PAN CARD IS REQUIRED No .ender Fee Int Total Fee int ₹ - 0.00] EMD Fee Details FINANCIAL BID EMD Amount in ₹ 0.00 EMD Percentage	T	ender	S					D	ate : 04-Aug-202	3 12:24	
Drganisation Chain University Department[[Jammu University][HOD Chemistry Fender Reference Wumber No./PGD/CHEM/23/3496 Yes Fender ID 2023_UDJK_224687_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes Fender ID 2023_UDJK_224687_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes Fender TD Open Tender Form of contract Item Rate Fender Tope Open Tender Form of contract Item Rate Fender Tope Services No. of Covers 2 Services No. of Covers 2 Services Yes Sayment Mode Not Applicable Is Multi Currency Allowed For BOQ Yes Yes Ulowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No No Sublic Currency No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Services Lower No Cover Document Type Description OEM authorization I Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf CERTIFICATE REQUI Past .pdf .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD REQUIRED .pdf .pdf .pdf .retintifeld is required NEEDED	Drganisation Chain University Department [Jammu University] [HOD Chemistry Fender Reference No./PGD/CHEM/23/3496 Fender TD 2023_UDJK_224687_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes Fender Type Open Tender Form of contract Item Rate Fender Type Open Tender Form of Contract Item Rate Seneral Technical No ItemWise Technical Yes Samment Mode Not Applicable Is Multi Currency Allowed For BOQ Yes S Multi Currency No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2 Description OEM authorization (CERTIFICATE REQUIR past) Cover No Cover Document Type Description Cover Over No Cover Description OEM authorization (CERTIFICATE REQUIR past) I Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf CERTIFICATE REQUIR past) I past .pdf Certificate is required .pdf .pdf GSTregistration (CERTIFICATE REQUIR Past) IT RETURNS FOR THE (LAST THREE YEARS NEEDED FERE) I .pdf .pdf IT RETURNS FOR THE (LAST THREE YEARS NEEDED FERE) FINANCIAL BID	Basic Details									Pri	
Tender Reference Number No./PGD/CHEM/23/3496 Tender ID 2023_UDJK_224687_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes Fender Type Open Tender Form of contract Item Rate Fender Type Open Tender Form of contract Item Rate General Technical Evaluation Allowed No ItemWise Technical Evaluation Allowed Yes Payment Mode Not Applicable Is Multi Currency Allowed For BOQ Yes Is Multi Currency Allowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Cover No Cover Document Type Description 1 Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf OEM authorization in relevant field is required CSTregistration certificate is required .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD REQUIRED .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD REQUIRED .pdf TTRETURNS FOR TH LAST THREE YEARS NEEDED .pdf CDPY OF PAN CARD REQUIRED .pdf EMD Fee Details. No Ender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00] EMD Fee Type EMD through BG/ST or EMD Exemption Allowed No	Tender Reference Number No./PGD/CHEM/23/3496 Tender ID 2023_UDJK_224687_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes Tender ID 2023_UDJK_224687_1 Withdrawal Allowed Yes Tender TD Open Tender Form of contract Item Rate Fender Category Services No. of Covers 2 General Technical Evaluation Allowed No Item Wise Technical Evaluation Allowed For BOQ Yes Payment Mode Not Applicable Is Multi Currency Allowed For BOQ No Period Cover Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2 Document Type Description Cover No Cover Document Type Description Cover No Cover Document Type Description Cover No Cover Ocwer Document Type Description I Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf CERTIFICATE REQUIR I Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf CERTIFICATE REQUIR I pdf .pdf GSTregistration certificate is required I Percental Fee in ₹ * - 0.00] EMD Fee Details FinAnCIAL BID Fender Fee in ₹ 0.00		ain Ilni	versity Department II	1200001110	nivorai						
Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Item Rate Fender Type Open Tender No. of Covers 2 Seneral Technical No ItemWise Technical Yes Svaluation Allowed No Is Multi Currency Allowed For BOQ Yes Payment Mode Not Applicable Is Multi Currency Allowed For BOQ Yes Sis Multi Currency No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2 Document Type Description Cover No Cover Document Type Description L Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf CERTIFICATE REQUI .pdf .pdf GSTregistration certificate is required .pdf .pdf GSTregistration certificate is required .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD I REQUIRED REQUIRED .pdf .pdf .pdf TERTURNS FOR THILLST THREE YEARS NEEDED .pdf .pdf .pdf EMD Fee Details .emption No EMD Fee Details EMD through BG/ST or EMD Recentage .emption No EMD Fee Type EMD Percentage No <	Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Item Rate Fender Type Open Tender Form of contract Item Rate Fender Category Services No. of Covers 2 Seneral Technical No ItemWise Technical Yes Sayment Mode Not Applicable Is Multi Currency Allowed For BOQ Yes shulti Currency No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2 Document Type Description Cover No Cover Document Type Description L Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf CERTIFICATE REQUIR	Tender Reference				niversi	ty]]HOD Chemistry					
Fender Type Open Tender Form of contract Item Rate Fender Category Services No. of Covers 2 General Technical No ItemWise Technical Yes Evaluation Allowed Not Applicable ItemWise Technical Yes Payment Mode Not Applicable ItemWise Technical Yes Is Multi Currency No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Klowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2 Document Type Description I Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf OEM authorization CERTIFICATE REQUI .pdf .pdf .pdf .ceptificate is required experience/performanin relevant field is required .pdf .pdf .cepUIRED .pdf .cepUIRED .pdf .pdf .cepUIRED .pdf .cepUIRED I Finance .xls FINANCIAL BID Eender Fee in ₹ 0.00 EMD Fee Details EMD through BG/ST or EMD Exemption Allowed Reemption No EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage No	Tender Type Open Tender Form of contract Hem Rate Fender Category Services No. of Covers 2 General Technical No ItemWise Technical Yes Valuation Allowed Not Applicable Is Multi Currency Allowed For BOQ Yes Payment Mode Not Applicable Is Multi Currency Allowed For BOQ Yes S Multi Currency No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2 Occument Type Description Cover No Cover Document Type Description I Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf OEM authorization (CRTIFICATE REQUIR .pdf .pdf .gerigistration (COVP OF PAN CARD IS REQUIRED) .pdf .pdf .pdf .gerigistration (Certificate is required) .pdf .pdf .pdf .ft REQUIRED .pdf .ft REQUIRED .pdf .pdf .ft REQUIRED .pdf .ft REQUIRED .pdf .pdf .ft REQUIRED .pdf .ft REQUIRED .et Finance .xls .ft REQUIRED .pdf .ft REQUIRED .et Prina	Fender ID	202	3 UDJK 224687 1		With	drawal Allowed		Yes			
render Category Services No. of Covers 2 Beneral Technical Evaluation Allowed No ItemWise Technical Evaluation Allowed Yes Payment Mode Not Applicable Is Multi Currency Allowed For BQQ Yes s Multi Currency Ulowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Cover Details. No. Of Covers - 2 No Document Type Description Cover No Cover Document Type Description OEM authorization CERTIFICATE REQUI I Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf CERTIFICATE REQUI past experience/performa in redevant field is required .pdf .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD I REQUIRED COPY OF PAN CARD I REQUIRED IT RETURNS FOR THI LAST THREE YEARS NEEDED .pdf .pdf .pdf IT RETURNS FOR THI LAST THREE YEARS NEEDED NEEDED .pdf .pdf .pdf IT RETURNS FOR THI LAST THREE YEARS NEEDED NEEDED .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf<	Tender Category Services No. of Covers 2 General Technical Evaluation Allowed No ItemWise Technical Evaluation Allowed Yes Payment Mode Not Applicable Is Multi Currency Allowed For BOQ Yes s Multi Currency No No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2 Document Type Description Cover No Cover Document Type OEM authorization (CRTIFICATE REQUIR Past experience/performan- in relevant field is required	Tender Type			· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	-			1.00	ate		
General Technical Valuation Allowed No ItemWise Technical Evaluation Allowed Yes Payment Mode Not Applicable Is Multi Currency Allowed For BOQ Yes is Multi Currency Mlowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2 No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Cover No Cover Document Type Description I Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf CERTIFICATE REQUI .pdf .pdf .certificate is required certificate is required .pdf .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD REQUIRED IT RETURNS FOR THILLAST THREE YEARS NEEDED .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .transform REQUIRED IT RETURNS FOR THILLAST THREE YEARS NEEDED .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf REQUIRED IT RETURNS FOR THILLAST THREE YEARS NEEDED .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf REQUIRED IT RETURNS FOR THILLAST THREE YEARS NEEDED .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf REQUIRED IT RETURNS FOR THILLAST THREE YEARS NEEDED .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf REQUIRED .pdf REQUIRED	General Technical Valuation Allowed No ItemWise Technical Evaluation Allowed Yes Payment Mode Not Applicable Is Multi Currency Allowed For BOQ Yes Yes is Multi Currency No No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2 Cover No Cover Document Type Description I Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf CRTIFICATE REQUIR past experience/performan in relevant field is required	ender Category	Ser	vices		No.	of Covers		+			
BOQ Yes s Multi Currency Mlowed For Fee No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2 Document Type Description Cover No Cover Document Type Description Image: State of the state	BOQ Yes is Multi Currency No Allow Two Stage Bidding No Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2 Document Type Description Cover No Cover Document Type Description Image: Strength of the strength of		I No						1			
Allow Two Stage Bidding No Cover Details. No. Of Covers - 2 Document Type Description L Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf OEM authorization CERTIFICATE REQUI .pdf .pdf oexperience/performal in relevant field is required .pdf .pdf GSTregistration certificate is required .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD I REQUIRED .pdf .pdf REQUIRED .pdf .pdf IT RETURNS FOR THILLAST THREE YEARS NEEDED .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf IT RETURNS FOR THILLAST THREE YEARS NEEDED .pdf .pdf .pdf	Allowed For Fee No Cover Details, No. Of Covers - 2 Document Type Description L Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf OEM authorization CERTIFICATE REQUIR past experience/performan in relevant field is required .pdf .pdf GSTregistration certificate is required .pdf .pdf COVP OF PAN CARD IS REQUIRED .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD IS REQUIRED .pdf .pdf TRETURNS FOR THE LAST THREE YEARS NEEDED .pdf .pdf IT RETURNS FOR THE LAST THREE YEARS NEEDED .pdf .pdf EMD Fee Details Tender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ - 0.00] EMD Fee Details Tender Fee No EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage Na EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable To Nil	Payment Mode	Not	Applicable		Is Multi Currency Allowed For			Yes			
Cover No Cover Document Type Description 1 Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf OEM authorization CERTIFICATE REQUI 1 .pdf .pdf .past experience/performal in relevant field is required .pdf .pdf .pdf .gdf .pdf .pdf .gdf .gdf .pdf .pdf .gdf .gdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .gettificate is required .pdf .pdf .pdf .fetDurst For Thi .pdf .pdf .pdf .fetDurst For Thi .pdf .pdf .pdf .fetDurst For Thi .pdf .pdf .pdf .pdf .sts Fender Fee No .sts FINANCIAL BID Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil Feeder Fee No .sts EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA	Cover No Cover Document Type Description 1 Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf OEM authorization CERTIFICATE REQUIR past experience/performan in relevant field is required .pdf .pdf gSTregistration certificate is required .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD IS REQUIRED .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD IS REQUIRED .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD IS REQUIRED .pdf .pdf IT RETURNS FOR THE LAST THREE YEARS NEEDED Pender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00] EMD Fee Details Fender Fee in ₹ 0.00 EMD Fee Details Fender Fee in ₹ No EMD Fee Details Wowed No EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage Na EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable To Nil		No	No			Allow Two Stage Bidding			No		
Image: Section of the section of	L Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf Description 1 Fee/PreQual/Technical .pdf OEM authorization CERTIFICATE REQUIR past experience/performan- in relevant field is required .pdf .pdf GSTregistration certificate is required .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD IS REQUIRED .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD IS REQUIRED .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD IS REQUIRED .pdf .pdf IT RETURNS FOR THE LAST THREE YEARS NEEDED Imance .xls FINANCIAL BID	Cover Details,	No. Of C	Covers - 2								
Image: Constrained of the constrained	I CENTIFICATE REQUIR past .pdf past .pdf experience/performanini nelevant field is required .pdf GSTregistration certificate is required .pdf .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD IS .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD IS .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD IS .pdf IT RETURNS FOR THE LAST THREE YEARS NEEDED .pdf .pdf .pdf IT RETURNS FOR THE LAST THREE YEARS NEEDED .pdf .pdf .pdf EMD Fee Details. Finance .xls Finance .xls Finance .not .pdf EMD Fee Details Eender Fee in ₹ 0.00 ie e Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil Ilowed No EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil	Cover No	Cover		D	Docum	nent Type			Description		
.pdf experience/performal in relevant field is required .pdf .pdf .pdf .	.pdf experience/performany in relevant field is required .pdf .pdf .pdf GSTregistration certificate is required .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD IS REQUIRED .pdf .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD IS REQUIRED .pdf .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD IS REQUIRED .pdf .pdf	L	Fee/PreQu	al/Technical				OEM authorization CERTIFICATE REQUIRE				
.pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD I REQUIRED .pdf .pdf IT RETURNS FOR THI LAST THREE YEARS NEEDED Pinance .xls FINANCIAL BID Fender Fee in ₹ 0.00 EMD Fee Details Fender Fee in ₹ 0.00 EMD Fee Details Fender Fee No Finance No Fee Payable At Nil	input certificate is required .pdf .pdf .pdf COPY OF PAN CARD IS REQUIRED IT RETURNS FOR THE .pdf .pdf .pdf IT RETURNS FOR THE .pdf .pdf .pdf IT RETURNS FOR THE LAST THREE YEARS NEEDED Pender Fee 0.00 Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil Fender Fee No Kxemption No Wlowed No EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Payable To Nil				.p				experience/performanc in relevant field is			
.pdf IT RETURNS FOR THILLAST THREE YEARS NEEDED Finance .xls FINANCIAL BID Fender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00] EMD Fee Details render Fee in ₹ 0.00 render Fee No Nil render Fee No render Fee No EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Fee Type fixed	.pdf REQUIRED IT RETURNS FOR THE LAST THREE YEARS NEEDED Finance .xls Fender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00] render Fee in ₹ 0.00 render Fee in ₹ 0.00 render Fee No render Fee				.р						uired	
.pdf LAST THREE YEARS NEEDED Prinance .xls FINANCIAL BID Fender Fee in ₹ 0.00 EMD Fee Details Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil Fender Fee No No EMD Fee Type Fixed EMD Fee Type Fixed EMD Percentage NA	.pdf LAST THREE YEARS NEEDED P. Finance .xls Finder Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00] EMD Fee Details Fender Fee in ₹ 0.00 Fee Payable To Nil EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable To Nil Click to view modification hist				.р	pdf						
Fender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ * - 0.00] EMD Fee Details render Fee in ₹ 0.00 render Fee in ₹ 0.00 render Fee No render Fee No <td< td=""><td>Fender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ • 0.00] EMD Fee Details render Fee in ₹ 0.00 EMD Fee Details render Fee No BG/ST or EMD Exemption Allowed Billowed EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable To Click to view modification hist</td><td colspan="3"></td><td>.p</td><td colspan="4">.pdf</td><td colspan="2"></td></td<>	Fender Fee Details, [Total Fee in ₹ • 0.00] EMD Fee Details render Fee in ₹ 0.00 EMD Fee Details render Fee No BG/ST or EMD Exemption Allowed Billowed EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable To Click to view modification hist				.p	.pdf						
Tender Fee in ₹ 0.00 EMD Amount in ₹ 0.00 EMD through BG/ST or EMD Exemption Allowed No Tender Fee xemption No EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA	Tender Fee in ₹ 0.00 EMD Amount in ₹ 0.00 EMD through BG/ST or EMD Exemption Allowed No Tender Fee exemption Mlowed No EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil	!	Finance		.x	kls				FINANCIAL BID		
eender Fee in ₹ 0.00 EMD Amount in ₹ 0.00 EMD through BG/ST or EMD Exemption Allowed No render Fee xemption No EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA	render Fee in ₹ 0.00 EMD Amount in ₹ 0.00 EMD through BG/ST or EMD Exemption Allowed No render Fee type No EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil	ender Fee De	tails. [To	otal Fee in ₹ * -	0.001		FMD Fee Details					
iee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil ender Fee No EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA	End No Fee Payable To Nil Fee Payable At Nil EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Payable To Nil Click to view modification hist						1		EMD through		No	
EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA	EMD Fee Type fixed EMD Percentage NA Illowed Nil EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil	ee Payable To	Nil	Fee Payable At	Nil			0.00	BG	ST or EMD		
	EMD Payable To Nil EMD Payable At Nil Click to view modification hist Click to view modification hist Click to view modification hist		INO			E	EMD Fee Type	fixed				
						E	EMD Payable To	Nil	EM	D Payable At	Nil	
Click to view modification hi									Click	to view modificati	on histo	
No Currency Conversion rate in ₹			SALARY & PETRON PROPERTY.									

 1
 US Dollar
 NA

 2
 European Euro
 NA

 3
 Japanese Yen
 NA

 Work /Item(s)

 Title
 NIT FOR WATER PURIFICATION SYSTEM

https://jktenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=%24DirectLink&page=PublishedViewTend... 8/4/2023

eProcurement System Government of Jammu And Kashmir

Details Independent NA External Monitor / Remarks NA Show Tender Value in Public Domain Yes Tender Value in ₹ 0.00 Product Category Service Support/Maintenance Service Sub category NA NA Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 60 Period Of Work (Days) 45 Location UNIVERSITY Pincode 180006 Pre Bid Meeting Pre Bid Meeting NA Dre Bid Meeting Date Date NA Bid Opening Place Chemistry UNIVERSITY OF JAMMU Should Allow NDA Fender NA Allow Preferential Bidder No Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2023 04:00 f Critical Dates 04-Aug-2023 05:00 PM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2023 11:00 A 28-Aug-2023 11:00 A Date 04-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Bid Submission End Date NA 28-Aug-2023 11:00 A Tender Documents IT O4-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Bid Submission End Date NA If endernotice 1.pdf O4-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Bid Submission End Date NA Star (In KB) ITendernotice 1.pdf	Pre Qualific	ation	Please refer	Tender docu	imente						
External Monitor / Remarks Show Tender Value in Public Domain Yes Tender Value in Proble Document Bid Validity(Days) 60 Period Of Work (Days) Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 60 Per Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting NA Pre Bid Meeting Date DEPARTMENT OF CHEMISTRY UNIVERSITY Procede Date DEPARTMENT OF CHEMISTRY UNIVERSITY OF Data Data DEPARTMENT OF CHEMISTRY UNIVERSITY OF Data Data Department Departm	Details	acion	ricase rerei								
in Public Domain Image: Support/Maintenance Sub category NA Tender Value in ₹ 0.00 Product Category Support/Maintenance Sub category NA Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 60 Period Of Work (Days) 45 Location UNIVERSITY Pincode 180006 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA DEPARTMENT OF CHARGE Address NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place DEPARTMENT OF CHARGE Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential Bidder No Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2023 04:00 F Critical Dates 04-Aug-2023 05:00 PM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2023 04:00 F 28-Aug-2023 04:00 F Document Download / Sale Start 04-Aug-2023 05:00 PM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2023 11:00 A Date 04-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Bid Submission End Date NA 28-Aug-2023 11:00 A Carification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 28-Aug-2023 11:00 A Tender Documents I Tendernotice_1.pdf Notice inviting tender PDF 14 Vork Item 1 Indement Name Description Size (in KB) <th>External</th> <th></th> <th>NA</th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th>	External		NA								
Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) Service Period Of Work (Days) 45 Location UNIVERSITY Pincode 180006 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA 5 Determine Place OF JAMMU Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place DEPARTMENT OF CHEMISTRY Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential Bidder No Bid Opening Date DEPARTMENT OF CHEMISTRY OF JAMMU Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential Bidder No Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2023 01:00 PM Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential Bidder No Document Download / Sale End Date 28-Aug-2023 11:00 A Critical Dates 04-Aug-2023 05:00 PM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2023 11:00 A Document Download / Sale Start 04-Aug-2023 05:00 PM Bid Submission End Date NA Sid Submission Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA Elefield Document S UT Tendernotice_1.pdf Notice inviting tender PDF 14 Vork Item S.No Document Name Description Document Size (in KB)			Yes								
Contract Type Tender Bid Validity(Days) 60 Period Of Work (Days) 45 Location UNIVERSITY OF JAMMU Iso006 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA Pre Bid Meeting Place NA Pre Bid Meeting Address NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place DEPARTMENT OF CHEMISTRY UNIVERSITY OF JAMMU Should Allow NDA Fender No Allow Preferential Bidder No Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2023 01:00 / Date 28-Aug-2023 11:00 / Date Critical Dates 04-Aug-2023 05:00 PM Document Download / Sale End Date 28-Aug-2023 11:00 / Date 28-Aug-2023 11:00 / Date Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA Decument Download / Sale End Date 28-Aug-2023 11:00 / Date 28-Aug-2023 11:00 / Date Finder Documents NA Clarification End Date NA I Boog Bid Submission End Date 28-Aug-2023 11:00 / Date 14 Vork Item Socument S.No Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) I BOQ BOQ_G38473.xds Financial bid 29 Bid Opener Login	Tender Valu	ie in ₹	0.00	Product C	ategory			Sub category		NA	
Location UNIVERSITY Pincode Gr JAMMU 180006 Pre Bid Meeting Place NA Pre Bid Meeting Address NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place DEPARTMENT OF CHEMISTRY OF JAMMU Should Allow NDA render No Allow Preferential Bidder No Bid Opening Date DEPARTMENT OF CHEMISTRY OF JAMMU Critical Dates Values 04-Aug-2023 05:00 PM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2023 01:00 P Critical Dates 04-Aug-2023 05:00 PM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2023 01:00 P Document Download / Sale Start 04-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Document Download / Sale End Date 28-Aug-2023 11:00 P Clarification Start Date 04-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 28-Aug-2023 11:00 P Sid Submission Start Date 04-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 28-Aug-2023 11:00 P Tender Documents IT IT Itendermotice_l.pdf Notice inviting tender PDF 14 Vork Item focuments S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name Dipenderkumarbaja@gmail.com Kamai Kapoor KAMAIK GUPTA AVVEK KUMAR BAJAJ Atmaika@gmail.com Kamai Kapoor<	Contract Ty	pe	Tender	Bid Validity(Days)						45	
Pre Bid Meeting Address NA Pre Bid Meeting Date NA Bid Opening Place DEPARTMENT OF CHEMISTRY UNIVERSTIY OF JAMMU Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential Bidder No Bid Opening Place DEPARTMENT OF CHEMISTRY UNIVERSTIY OF JAMMU Critical Dates Pre Bid Meeting Bidder No Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2023 04:00 F Critical Dates Of-Aug-2023 05:00 PM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2023 04:00 F Document Download / Sale Start Of-Aug-2023 05:00 PM Document Download / Sale End Date 28-Aug-2023 11:00 A Date NA Clarification End Date NA Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA Tender Documents IT IT It rendemotice_l.pdf Notice inviting tender PDF 14 Vork Item Isocuments S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size (in KB is Bid Opener Ligit Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name No Bid Opener Ligit Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Rame BIDENDER KUMAR BAJAD 29 Bid Openers List Show Bids Details Antk GupTA Vivek KUMAR GUPTA Vivek KUMAR GUPTA No Bid Opener Ligit Id Bid Opener Name Show Technical bid status Yes No <	Location			Pincode	Pincode		0006	Pre Bid Meeting		NA	
Should Allow NDA No Allow Preferential Bidder No Critical Dates O4-Aug-2023 05:00 PM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2023 04:00 F Publish Date O4-Aug-2023 05:00 PM Document Download / Sale End Date 28-Aug-2023 11:00 A Date Date Clarification End Date NA Clarification End Date NA Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA 28-Aug-2023 11:00 A Sid Submission Start Date 04-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Bid Submission End Date NA Sid Submission Start Date 04-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Bid Submission End Date NA Fender Documents Umage: Sid Submission End Date NA Sid Submission End Date NA I Tendernotice_1.pdf Notice inviting tender PDF 14 Vork Item bocuments S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) Sid Openers List IBOQ BOQ. 638473.xls Financial bid 29 Sid Openers List No Maraikkaggmail.com Kamai Kapoor KAMAL KISHORE KAPOO Amaikka@gmail.com Bigender Baja BILENDER KUMAR BAJAJ ANIK GUPTA	Pre Bid Mee Address	ting								CHEMISTRY UNIVERSITY OF	
Publish Date 04-Aug-2023 05:00 PM Bid Opening Date 28-Aug-2023 01:00 PM Document Download / Sale Start 04-Aug-2023 05:00 PM Document Download / Sale End 28-Aug-2023 11:00 A Date 04-Aug-2023 05:00 PM Document Download / Sale End 28-Aug-2023 11:00 A Date NA Clarification End Date NA Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA Frender Documents 04-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Bid Submission End Date NA Tender Documents 04-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Bid Submission End Date NA Tender Documents S.No Document Name Description Document 1 Tendernotice_1.pdf Notice inviting tender PDF 14 Vork Item bocuments S.No Document Type Document Name Description Size (in KB) 1 BOQ BOQ_638473.xls Financial bid 29 Bid Openers List Side Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name Dipenderkumarbaja@gmail.com Kamal Kapoor KAMAL KISHORE KAPOO Kamal Kapoor KAMAL KISHORE KAPOO	Should Allov Tender	w NDA	No		erential	No					
Document Download / Sale Start Or Aug-2023 05:00 PM Document Download / Sale End Date NA Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA Sid Submission Start Date 04-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Bid Submission End Date NA Tender Documents Description Document Size (in KB) I Tendermotice_1.pdf Notice inviting tender PDF 14 Vork Item bocuments S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) Bid Openers List S.No BoQ BOQ_638473.xls Financial bid 29 Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name Discense KUMAR BAJAD kamalkka@gmail.com Kamal Kapoor KAMAL KISHORE KAPAD kamalkka@gmail.com Kamal Kapoor KAMAL KISHORE KAPAD vivek.guptazk9@gmail.com Wivek Gupta Vivek KUMAR GUPTA vivek.guptazk9@gmail.com Vivek Gupta Vivek KUMAR GUPTA vivek.guptazk9@gmail.com Vivek Gupta Show Technical bid status Yes Goorgarative Chart isode Yes </td <td>Critical Da</td> <td>ites</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td>	Critical Da	ites									
Document Download / Sale Start 04-Aug-2023 05:00 PM Document Download / Sale End Date 28-Aug-2023 11:00 A Clarification Start Date NA Clarification End Date NA Sid Submission Start Date 04-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Bid Submission End Date NA Tender Documents 04-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Bid Submission End Date NA Tender Documents 04-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Bid Submission End Date NA Tender Documents S.No Document Name Description Document 1 Tendernotice_1.pdf Notice inviting tender PDF 14 Vork Item bocuments S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) 1 BOQ BOQ_638473.xls Financial bid 29	Publish Date	e		04-Aug-20	023 05:00 F	PM	Bid Opening Da	ite	28-	Aug-2023	04:00 PM
Bid Submission Start Date O4-Aug-2023 06:00 PM Bid Submission End Date Date Tender Documents IT Bid Submission End Date 28-Aug-2023 11:00 A IT S.No Document Name Description Size (in KB) I Tendernotice_1.pdf Notice inviting tender PDF 14 Vork Item focument S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) I BOQ BOQ_638473.xds Financial bid 29 Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name I BOQ_638473.xds Financial bid 29 Bid Openers List Side Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name Interctorit Bigingunuuniversity.ac.in Anik Kupta ANIK GUPTA Amalka@gmail.com Kamal Kapoor KAMAL KGUPTA Vivek.gupta2k9@gmail.com Vivek Gupta VIVEK KUMAR GUPTA Fender Properties Vivek Gupta VIVEK KUMAR GUPTA Vivek Finance bid Yes Show Technical bid status Yes Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details No	Document D Date	Downloa	d / Sale Star	: 04-Aug-20	023 05:00 F	PM		nload / Sale End			
Tender Documents Description Document Size (in KB) 1 Tendernotice_1.pdf Notice inviting tender PDF 14 Vork Item bocuments S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) 1 BOQ BOQ_638473.xls Financial bid 29 Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name 2 Bid Openers List Simo Simo Kumatka@gmail.com Kamal Kapoor KAMAL KISHORE KAPOO 4 directorit@lammuuniversity.ac.in Anik Gupta Vivek Gupta Vivek KUMAR GUPTA 1 vivek.gupta2k9@gmail.com Vivek Gupta Vivek KUMAR GUPTA Yes auto Tendering No Show Bids Details No 00 Comparative Chart Normal BoQ Comparative chart decimal places 2 00 Comparative Chart Normal BoQ Comparative chart decimal places 2	Clarification	Start D	ate	NA			Clarification En	d Date	NA		
IIT Document S.No Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) 1 Tendemotice_1.pdf Notice inviting tender PDF 14 Vork Item Jocuments S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) 1 BOQ BOQ_638473.xls Financial bid 29 Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Bajaj BIJENDER KUMAR BAJAJ . bijenderkumarbajaj@gmail.com Kamal Kapoor KAMAL KISHORE KAPOO . kamalkka@gmail.com Kamal Kapoor KAMAL KISHORE KAPOO . wivek.gupta2k9@gmail.com Vivek Gupta VIVEK KUMAR GUPTA . wivek.gupta2k9@gmail.com Vivek Gupta VIVEK KUMAR GUPTA . Vivek Gupta VIVEK KUMAR GUPTA Yes . Show Technical bid status Yes . Show Bids Details No . Yes Show Bids Details No . Yes Show Bids Details No . Antractional Back BoQ No No	Bid Submiss	ion Sta	rt Date	04-Aug-20	023 06:00 F	PM	Bid Submission	End Date	28-	Aug-2023	11:00 AM
Image:	NIT Document S.No										
S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) 1 BOQ BOQ_638473.xls Financial bid 29 Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name bijenderkumarbajaj@gmail.com Bijender Bajaj BIJENDER KUMAR BAJAJ kamalkka@gmail.com KAMAL KISHORE KAPOO . Amik Gugmail.com Kamal Kapoor KAMAL KISHORE KAPOO ANIK GUPTA . wivek.gupta2k9@gmail.com Vivek Gupta VIVEK KUMAR GUPTA . Vivek.gupta2k9@gmail.com Vivek Gupta VIVEK KUMAR GUPTA . Vivek Gupta VIVEK KUMAR GUPTA VIVEK KUMAR GUPTA . Vivek Gupta VIVEK KUMAR GUPTA VIVEK KUMAR GUPTA		S.No	Document Na	me		De	scription				
I BOQ BOQ_638473.xls Financial bid 29 Bid Openers List Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name bijenderkumarbajaj@gmail.com Bijender Bajaj BIJENDER KUMAR BAJAJ kamalkka@gmail.com Kamal Kapoor KAMAL KISHORE KAPOO directorit@jammuuniversity.ac.in Anik Gupta ANIK GUPTA vivek.gupta2k9@gmail.com Vivek Gupta VIVEK KUMAR GUPTA Fender Properties Nuto Tendering Process allowed Yes Show Technical bid status Yes oQ Comparative Chart oodel Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2 oQ Comparative Chart ank Type L Form Based BoQ No								PDF			(in KB)
Bid Openers List Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name bijenderkumarbajaj@gmail.com Bijender Bajaj BIJENDER KUMAR BAJAJ kamalkka@gmail.com Karnal Kapoor KAMAL KISHORE KAPOO directorit@jammuuniversity.ac.in Anik Gupta ANIK GUPTA vivek.gupta2k9@gmail.com Vivek Gupta VIVEK KUMAR GUPTA Show Technical bid status Yes Show Technical bid status Yes vivek Finance bid tatus Yes Show Bids Details No oQ Comparative Chart oxel Normal BoQ Comparative chart decimal places 2 oQ Comparative Chart ank Type L Form Based BoQ No	Document Nork Item		endernotice_1.	pdf	Documer	Not	ice inviting tender	1		Size	(in KB) 140.7
bijenderkumarbajaj@gmail.com Bijender Bajaj BIJENDER KUMAR BAJAJ kamalkka@gmail.com Kamal Kapoor KAMAL KISHORE KAPOO directorit@jammuuniversity.ac.in Anik Gupta ANIK GUPTA vivek.gupta2k9@gmail.com Vivek Gupta VIVEK KUMAR GUPTA Fender Properties Vivek Gupta VIVEK KUMAR GUPTA Vivek Finance bid Yes Show Technical bid status Yes Show Finance bid Yes Show Bids Details No oQ Comparative Chart Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2 oQ Comparative Chart L Form Based BoQ No		1 1 S.No	endernotice_1.	pdf		Not	ice inviting tender	Description		Size	(in KB) 140.7 Iment
kamalkka@gmail.com Kamal Kapoor KAMAL KISHORE KAPOO	Document Vork Item Documents Bid Opene	1 S.No 1 Ers List	Tendernotice_1.	pdf De	BOQ_6384	Not	ice inviting tender ame Is	Description Financial bid		Size Docu Size	(in KB) 140.7 Iment (in KB) 295.5
vivek.gupta2k9@gmail.com Vivek Gupta VIVEK KUMAR GUPTA Fender Properties Show Technical bid status Yes No Show Technical bid status Yes Show Finance bid tatus Yes Show Bids Details No oQ Comparative Chart ooQ Comparative Chart ank Type Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2	Document Work Item Documents Bid Opene 5.No	S.No I 1 E	ener Login Id	pdf De	BOQ_6384	Not	ice inviting tender ame Is pener Name	Description Financial bid		Size Docu Size	(in KB) 140.7 Iment (in KB) 295.5
vivek.gupta2k9@gmail.com Vivek Gupta VIVEK KUMAR GUPTA Fender Properties Show Technical bid status Yes No Show Technical bid status Yes Show Finance bid tatus Yes Show Bids Details No oQ Comparative Chart ooQ Comparative Chart ank Type Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2	Nork Item Documents Documents Bid Opene 5.No	S.No I 1 E	ener Login Id kumarbajaj@gr	pdf De	BOQ_6384 Bij Bij	Not	ice inviting tender ame Is pener Name er Bajaj	Description Financial bid	BIJEND	Size Docu Size icate Nan	(in KB) 140.7 Iment (in KB) 295.5 R BAJAJ
NoShow Technical bid statusYesProcess allowedYesShow Finance bid tatusYesShow Bids DetailsNoShow Finance bid tatusYesShow Bids DetailsNoSoQ Comparative Chart nodelNormalBoQ Compartive chart decimal places2SoQ Comparative Chart ank TypeLForm Based BoQNo	Nork Item Documents Documents Bid Opene 5.No	S.No I S.No I 1 E Bid Op bijender kamalkk director	ener Login Id kumarbajaj@gr a@gmail.com	pdf pe nail.com rsity.ac.in	BOQ_6384 Bij Ka An	id O int National int National int National int State int State in	ice inviting tender ame Is pener Name er Bajaj Kapoor upta	Description Financial bid	BIJEND KAMAL	Size Docu Size icate Nan ER KUMAI KISHORE	(in KB) 140.7 Iment (in KB) 295.5 R BAJAJ
Process allowed Show Bids Details No Show Finance bid tatus Yes Show Bids Details No oQ Comparative Chart nodel Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2 oQ Comparative Chart ank Type L Form Based BoQ No	Nork Item Documents Documents Bid Opene 5.No	S.No I S.No I 1 E Bid Op bijender kamalkk director	ener Login Id kumarbajaj@gr a@gmail.com	pdf pe nail.com rsity.ac.in	BOQ_6384 Bij Ka An	id O int National int National int National int State int State in	ice inviting tender ame Is pener Name er Bajaj Kapoor upta	Description Financial bid	BIJEND KAMAL ANIK G	Size Docu Size icate Nan ER KUMAI KISHORE UPTA	(in KB) 140.7 Iment (in KB) 295.5 R BAJAJ KAPOOR
tatus Instruction oQ Comparative Chart Normal odel BoQ Compartive chart decimal places oQ Comparative Chart L oQ Comparative Chart L ank Type Form Based BoQ	Nork Item Documents Documents Bid Opene S.No	S.No I S.No I 1 E Bid Op bijender kamalkk director vivek.gu	endernotice_1.	pdf pe nail.com rsity.ac.in	BOQ_6384 Bij Ka An	id O int National int National int National int State int State in	ice inviting tender ame Is pener Name er Bajaj Kapoor upta	Description Financial bid	BIJEND KAMAL ANIK G	Size Docu Size icate Nan ER KUMAI KISHORE UPTA	(in KB) 140.7 Iment (in KB) 295.5 R BAJAJ KAPOOR
nodel oQ Comparative Chart L Form Based BoQ No ank Type	Nork Item Nork Item Documents Bid Opene 5.No 5.No 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7.	I S.No I I Bid Op bijender kamalkk director vivek.gu	endernotice_1.	pdf pe nail.com rsity.ac.in	BOQ_6384 Bij Ka An	id O int National int National int National int State int State in	ice inviting tender ame Is pener Name er Bajaj Kapoor upta Supta	Description Financial bid	BIJEND KAMAL ANIK G /IVEK I	Size Docu Size	(in KB) 140.7 Iment (in KB) 295.5 295.5 Re R BAJAJ KAPOOR JPTA
ank Type	Nork Item Documents Documents Bid Opene 5.No 5.No 5.No 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7.	I S.No I S.No I I E Bid Op bijender kamalkk directori vivek.gu	ener Login Id kumarbajaj@gr a@gmail.com t@jammuunive ipta2k9@gmail.	pdf pe nail.com rsity.ac.in	BOQ_6384 Bij Ka An	id O int National int National int National int State int State in	ice inviting tender ame Is pener Name er Bajaj Kapoor upta Supta Si	Description Financial bid	BIJEND KAMAL ANIK G /IVEK I	Size Docu Size	(in KB) 140.7 Iment (in KB) 295.5 295.5 Re R BAJAJ KAPOOR JPTA
	Nork Item Documents Documents Bid Opene 5.No 5.No 5.No 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7.	I I I S.No I I E Bid Op bijender kamalkk directori vivek.gu opertie ing wed ce bid	endernotice_1. Document Typ OQ ener Login Id kumarbajaj@gr a@gmail.com t@jammuunive pta2k9@gmail. SS No Yes t Normal	pdf pe nail.com rsity.ac.in	BOQ_6384 Bij Ka An	id O int National int National int National int State int State in	ice inviting tender ame Is pener Name er Bajaj Kapoor upta Supta Si Si Bo	Description Financial bid	BIJEND KAMAL ANIK G VIVEK I	Size Docu Size	(in KB) 140.7 Iment (in KB) 295.5 295.5 Ne R BAJAJ KAPOOR JPTA Yes No 2
	Nork Item Documents Documents Bid Opene 5.No 5.No 5.No 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7. 7.	I I I S.No I I E Bid Op bijender kamalkk directori vivek.gu opertie ing wed ce bid	endernotice_1. Document Typ OQ ener Login Id kumarbajaj@gr a@gmail.com t@jammuunive pta2k9@gmail. SS No Yes t Normal	pdf pe nail.com rsity.ac.in	BOQ_6384 Bij Ka An	id O int National int National int National int State int State in	ice inviting tender ame Is pener Name er Bajaj Kapoor upta Supta Si Si Bo	Description Financial bid	BIJEND KAMAL ANIK G VIVEK I	Size Docu Size	(in KB) 140.7 Iment (in KB) 295.5 295.5 Re BAJAJ KAPOOR JPTA Yes No 2

https://jktenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=%24DirectLink&page=PublishedViewTend... 8/4/2023

eProcurement System Government of Jammu And Kashmir

à

Show Bid Details in P Domain stage	ublic
Tender Inviting	Authority
Name	HEAD OF THE DEPARTMENT
Address	HEAD OF THE DEPARTMENT OF CHEMISTRY , UNIVERSITY OF JAMMU
Tender Creator	Details
Created By	Kamal Kapoor
Designation	Professor
Created Date	03-Aug-2023 01:50 PM

https://jktenders.gov.in/nicgep/app?component=%24DirectLink&page=PublishedViewTend... 8/4/2023